Local Agency: Dwight

County: Livingston

Section: 26-00000-00-GM

Project No. 66551.00

10:00a.m.,Wednesday, May 20, 2026

BID TABULATION

Bidder & Address Total Bid Bid Comments

Security
D Construction Inc. $197,378.20 Bid Bond
1488 South Broadway
Coal City, IL 60450
Kankakee Valley Construction $278,497.50 Bid Bond
4356 W.IL Rt. 17 P.O. Box 767
Kankakee, IL 60901
Austin Tyler Construction, Inc. No Bid
23343 S. Ridge Road
Elwood, IL 60421
Gallagher Asphalt Corp. No Bid
18100 South Indiana Ave.
Thornton, IL 60476
HJ Eppel & Company Inc. No Bid
1400 Tuesburg Court
Pontiac, IL 61764
Phoenix Corp of the QC No Bid
1006 Roehill Road
Port Byron, IL 61275
PT Ferro Construction No Bid

700 South Rowell Avenue
Joliet, IL 60433




Tabulation of Bids

Local Agency: Dwight

County: Livingston
Section: 26-00000-00-GM
Bid Date: 10:00a.m.,Wednesday, May 20, 2026

Approved Engineer's Estimate

Bidder Name
Address
City, State, Zip

D Construction Inc.

1488 South Broadway
Coal City, IL 60450

Kankakee Valley Construction
4356 W. IL Rt. 17 P.O. Box 767

Kankakee, IL 60901

|$254,427.50 Proposal Guarantee Bid Bond Bid Bond
Terms
Approved Engineers Estimate
NO. ITEM Unit Qty UNIT AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
PRICE

1 Hot-Mix Asphalt Surface Removal SY 10600 $4.00| $42,400.00 $3.51 $37,206.00 $3.70 $39,220.00
2 Bituminous Materials (Tack Coat) LB 7000 $1.50| $10,500.00 $0.01 $70.00 $0.01 $70.00
3 Hot-Mix Poly Asphalt Binder Course, IL-4.75 TON 450 $125.00f $56,250.00 $112.50 $50,625.00 $163.00 $73,350.00
4 Hot-Mix Asphalt Surface Course, Mix "D", N50 TON 875 $115.00| $100,625.00 $81.00 $70,875.00 $112.00 $98,000.00
5 Class D Patching SY 300 $70.00] $21,000.00 $33.00 $9,900.00 $140.00 $42,000.00
6 Structure Repair with New Frame & Grate EA 6| $1,500.00 $9,000.00 $2,000.00 $12,000.00 $900.00 $5,400.00
7 Curb & Gutter Remove & Replace FT 60 $75.00 $4,500.00 $100.00 $6,000.00 $175.00 $10,500.00
8 Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Line, 4" FT 5015 $1.50 $7,522.50 $1.60 $8,024.00 $1.50 $7,522.50
9 Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Line, 6" FT 620 $2.50 $1,550.00 $2.53 $1,568.60 $2.30 $1,426.00
10 Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Line, 12" FT 100 $6.00 $600.00 $5.06 $506.00 $4.60 $460.00
11 Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Line, 24" FT 60 $8.00 $480.00 $10.06 $603.60 $9.15 $549.00
Total Bid: As Calculated $197,378.20 $278,497.50

As Read

[% Over/Under




