CITY OF MORRIS
WAVERLY ST. WATER MAIN REPLACEMENT

Project No. 99086.00

10:00AM, Thursday, April 2, 2026

BID TABULATION

Bidder & Address

Total Bid

Bid
Security

Acknowledge
Addenda

Comments

Conley Excavating
1555 Gramercy Place
Morris, IL 60450

$552,156.50

Bid Bond

Yes

D Construction Inc.
1488 South Broadway
Coal City, IL 60450

$571,533.00

Bid Bond

Yes

Scanlon Excavating & Concrete, Inc. $602,813.00

630 S. 7000W Road
Kankakee, IL 60901

Bid Bond

Yes

Stott Contracting
6630 N. Ashton Road
Morris, IL 60450

$771,328.00

Bid Bond

Yes

Bisping Construction Co., Inc.
110 Ford Drive
New Lenox, IL 60451

$833,679.86

Bid Bond

Yes

H. Linden & Sons, Inc.
722 E. South St., Unit D
Plano, IL 60545

No Bid

Performance Const & Eng LL.C
217 W. John Street
Plano, IL 60545

No Bid

PT Ferro Construction
700 South Rowell Avenue
Joliet, IL 60433

No Bid

Superior Excavating
424 San Carlos Road
Minooka, IL 60447

No Bid




BID LETTING: City of Morris

Waverly St. Water Main Replacement

10:00AM, Thursday, April 2, 2026

BIDDER & ADDRESS

Conley Excavating
1555 Gramercy Place
Morris, IL 60450

Scanlon Excavating & Concrete, Inc.
630 S. 7000W Road
Kankakee, IL 60901

Stott Contracting

6630 N. Ashton

Road

Morris, IL 60450

D Construction Inc.
1488 South Broadway
Coal City, IL 60450

Bisping Construction Co., Inc.
110 Ford Drive
New Lenox, IL 60451

BID DEPOSIT Bid Bond Bid Bond Bid Bond Bid Bond Bid Bond

ACKNOWLEDGE ADDENDA es Yes Yes Yes Yes

NO.| QTY | UNIT [ITEM UNIT AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT

PRICE
1 | 655 CY |TRENCH BACKFILL $37.00 $24,235.00 $50.00 $32,750.00 $60.00 $39,300.00 $60.00 $39,300.00 $35.65 $23,350.75
2 1 [L SUM|PARKWAY RESTORATION $19,800.00 $19,800.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $49,965.00 $49,965.00|  $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $20,058.85 $20,058.85
3 3 EACH |INLET AND PIPE PROTECTION $300.00 $900.00 $160.00 $480.00 $300.00 $900.00 $300.00 $900.00 $316.24 $948.72
4 | 143 SY |PCC DRIVEWAY REMOVE & REPLACE $154.00 $22,022.00 $150.00 $21,450.00 $216.00 $30,888.00 $110.00 $15,730.00 $109.35 $15,637.05
5 | 2315 SF  |PCC SIDEWALK 5 INCH, SPECIAL $13.50 $31,252.50 $14.00 $32,410.00 $15.00 $34,725.00 $10.00 $23,150.00 $13.47 $31,183.05
6 | 100 SF  |DETECTABLE WARNINGS $55.00 $5,500.00 $40.00 $4,000.00 $40.00 $4,000.00 $40.00 $4,000.00 $12.04 $1,204.00
7 | 170 FT |COMBINATION CURB AND GUTTER REMOVE & $58.50 $9,945.00 $60.00 $10,200.00 $75.00 $12,750.00 $60.00 $10,200.00 $67.52 $11,478.40
8 | 2149 SF  [SIDEWALK REMOVAL $3.00 $6,447.00 $2.00 $4,298.00 $5.00 $10,745.00 $4.00 $8,596.00 $1.57 $3,373.93
9 40 FT |WATER MAIN CASING PIPE $110.00 $4,400.00 $125.00 $5,000.00 $100.00 $4,000.00 $400.00 $16,000.00 $85.52 $3,420.80
10 6 FT |PVC WATER MAIN, 6" $268.00 $1,608.00 $150.00 $900.00 $150.00 $900.00 $737.00 $4,422.00 $350.52 $2,103.12
11| 23 FT |PVC WATER MAIN, 8" $185.50 $4,266.50 $150.00 $3,450.00 $170.00 $3,910.00 $261.00 $6,003.00 $193.79 $4,457.17
12 5 FT |PVC WATER MAIN, 10" $571.00 $2,855.00 $300.00 $1,500.00 $200.00 $1,000.00 $897.00 $4,485.00 $442.89 $2,214.45
13 | 978 FT |PVC WATER MAIN, 12" $184.00 $179,952.00 $175.00 $171,150.00 $270.00 $264,060.00 $134.00 $131,052.00 $307.55 $300,783.90
14| 73 FT |DUCTILE IRON WATER MAIN, 12" $250.00 $18,250.00 $625.00 $45,625.00 $306.00 $22,338.00 $232.00 $16,936.00 $487.57 $35,592.61
15 | 143 FT |TEMPORARY PVC WATER MAIN (RJIB), 12" $134.00 $19,162.00 $300.00 $42,900.00 $326.00 $46,618.00 $264.00 $37,752.00 $256.97 $36,746.71
16 2 EA |WATER GATE VALVE AND BOX, 8" $3,690.00 $7,380.00 $3,300.00 $6,600.00 $3,022.00 $6,044.00 $3,800.00 $7,600.00 $3,168.81 $6,337.62
17 4 EA |WATER GATE VALVE AND BOX, 12" $5,790.00 $23,160.00 $6,500.00 $26,000.00 $4,909.00 $19,636.00 $6,000.00 $24,000.00 $6,771.52 $27,086.08
18 4 EA |FIRE HYDRANT WITH AUXILIARY VALVE AND VALVE $9,780.00 $39,120.00 $8,500.00 $34,000.00 $7,094.00 $28,376.00 $9,000.00 $36,000.00 $13,924.80 $55,699.20
BOX

19 1 EA |INSERTION VALVE AND VALVE BOX, 10" $17,993.00 $17,993.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $15,750.00 $15,750.00|  $18,000.00 $18,000.00 $24,825.16 $24,825.16
20 1 EA |INSERTION VALVE AND VALVE BOX, 12" $19,481.00 $19,481.00 $13,500.00 $13,500.00 $17,507.00 $17,507.00f  $19,000.00 $19,000.00 $23,849.93 $23,849.93
21 1 EA |STUMP REMOVAL $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,350.00 $1,350.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $2,953.11 $2,953.11
22| 126 SY |CLASS D PAVEMENT PATCHES $119.50 $15,057.00 $100.00 $12,600.00 $200.00 $25,200.00 $130.00 $16,380.00 $125.16 $15,770.16
23| 73 FT |WATER MAIN INSULATION $176.50 $12,884.50 $200.00 $14,600.00 $325.00 $23,725.00 $199.00 $14,527.00 $331.71 $24,214.83
24 5 EA |CUT-IN CONNECTION TO EXISTING WATER MAIN $5,680.00 $28,400.00 $4,500.00 $22,500.00 $4,770.40 $23,852.00 $2,000.00 $10,000.00 $15,605.38 $78,026.90
25 1 EA |PRESSURE CONNECTION TO EXISTING WATER MAIN $6,726.00 $6,726.00 $11,000.00 $11,000.00 $15,719.00 $15,719.00 $9,500.00 $9,500.00 $15,382.70 $15,382.70
26 6 EA |WATER SERVICE CONNECTION $2,810.00 $16,860.00 $3,850.00 $23,100.00 $2,575.00 $15,450.00 $5,000.00 $30,000.00 $4,965.57 $29,793.42
27| 1 |L.SUM|WATER MAIN ABANDONMENT $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $16,500.00 $16,500.00]  $41,120.00 $41,120.00| $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $17,483.76 $17,483.76
28| 100 FT |MISCELLANEOUS TILE REPAIR $50.00 $5,000.00 $50.00 $5,000.00 $100.00 $10,000.00 $100.00 $10,000.00 $126.14 $12,614.00
29 2 EA |FIRE HYDRANTS TO BE REMOVED $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,400.00 $2,800.00 $750.00 $1,500.00 $3,500.00 $7,000.00 $3,544.74 $7,089.48

TOTAL $552,156.50 $602,813.00 $771,328.00 $571,533.00 $833,679.86




