
Bidder & Address Total Bid Bid 

Security

Comments

Conley Excavating 

1555 Gramercy Place 

Morris, IL  60450

$385,477.00 Bid Bond

D Construction Inc.

1488 South Broadway

Coal City, IL  60450

$497,989.00 Bid Bond

Airy's Inc.

7455 Duvan Dr.

Tinley Park, IL  60477

No Bid

Austin Tyler Construction, Inc.

23343 S. Ridge Road

Elwood, IL  60421

No Bid

Bisping Construction Company, Inc.

110 Ford Drive

New Lenox, IL 60451

No Bid

PT Ferro Construction

700 South Rowell Avenue

Joliet, IL  60433

No Bid

Scanlon Excavating & Concrete, Inc.

630 S. 7000W Road

Kankakee, IL  60901

No Bid

Stott Contracting 

6630 N. Ashton Road 

Morris, IL  60450

No Bid

Superior Excavating

424 San Carlos Road

Minooka, IL  60447

No Bid

VILLAGE OF GARDNER

2026 SANITARY SEWER & 

WATER MAIN EXTENSION

BID TABULATION

Project No. 9871.01 

10:00AM, Tuesday, April 7, 2026



BID LETTING: Village of Gardner

2026 Sanitary Sewer & 

Water Main Extension

10:00AM, Tuesday, April 7, 2026

NO. QTY UNIT ITEM UNIT 

PRICE   

AMOUNT    UNIT PRICE  AMOUNT 

1 43 CY Trench Backfill, Special $91.00 $3,913.00 $100.00 $4,300.00

2 2 EA Structure to be Removed $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $5,000.00 $10,000.00

3 1 EA Drop Manhole, 4' Dia. $14,050.00 $14,050.00 $24,000.00 $24,000.00

4 2 EA Sanitary Manhole, Ty A, 4' Dia. Water-Tight Ty 1 $8,810.00 $17,620.00 $14,000.00 $28,000.00

5 606 LF PVC Sanitary Sewer, 10" SDR-26 $187.00 $113,322.00 $228.00 $138,168.00

6 134 LF PVC Water Main, 10" C-900 $214.00 $28,676.00 $304.00 $40,736.00

7 131 LF Steel Casing, 20" $806.00 $105,586.00 $1,235.00 $161,785.00

8 1 EA Fire Hydrant w/ Aux Valve $14,000.00 $14,000.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00

9 1 EA Water Valve, 10" $6,010.00 $6,010.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00

10 1 EA Cut-In Connection $5,725.00 $5,725.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00

11 60 SY Pavement Patch, Class B $180.00 $10,800.00 $300.00 $18,000.00

12 16 SY Pavement Patch, Class D $180.00 $2,880.00 $500.00 $8,000.00

13 1 LS Landscape Restoration $30,800.00 $30,800.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00

14 1 LS Construction Layout $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00

15 1 LS Traffic Control $18,120.00 $18,120.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00

16 6 EA Temporary Ditch Check $250.00 $1,500.00 $500.00 $3,000.00

17 350 LF Silt Fence $8.50 $2,975.00 $10.00 $3,500.00

TOTAL $385,477.00 $497,989.00

D Construction Inc.

1488 South Broadway

Coal City, IL  60450

BIDDER & ADDRESS Conley Excavating 

1555 Gramercy Place 

Morris, IL  60450

Bid BondBID DEPOSIT Bid Bond


