Local Agency: Millington

County: Kendall

Section: 25-00000-00-GM
Project No. 66528.00

10:00A.M., Tuesday, August 12, 2025

BID TABULATION

Bidder & Address Total Bid Bid Comments

Security
D Construction Inc. $115,340.00 Bid Bond
1488 South Broadway
Coal City, IL 60450
Universal Asphalt & Exc., Inc. $139,324.00 Bid Bond
P.O. Box 1636
LaSalle, IL 61301
Builders Paving, LLC No Bid
4401 Roosevelt Rd.
Hillside, IL 60162
PT Ferro Construction No Bid

700 South Rowell Avenue
Joliet, IL 60433




Tabulation of Bids

Local Agency: Millington

County: Kendall
Section: 25-00000-00-GM
Bid Date: 10:00A.M., Tuesday, August 12, 2025

Bidder Name Builders Paving, LLC D Construction Inc. Universal Asphalt & Exc., Inc. |PT Ferro Construction
Address 4401 Roosevelt Rd. 1488 South Broadway P.O. Box 1636 700 South Rowell Avenue
Approved Engineer's Estimate City, State, Zip Hillside, IL 60162 Coal City, IL 60450 LaSalle, IL 61301 Joliet, IL 60433
|$143,750.00 Proposal Guarantee No Bid Bid Bond Bid Bond No Bid
Terms
Approved Engineers Estimate
NO. ITEM Unit |Qty UNIT AMOUNT UNIT AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE [ AMOUNT
PRICE PRICE
1 Class D Patching sy 120 $50.00 $6,000.00 $100.00 $12,000.00 $70.00 $8,400.00
2 HMA Surface Removal, 2.5" sy 6200 $4.00] $24,800.00 $4.08 $25,296.00 $4.00 $24,800.00
3 Bituminous Materials (Tack Coat) Ib 4400 $1.50 $6,600.00 $0.01 $44.00 $0.01 $44.00
4 HMA Binder Course, IL-9.5, N50 ton 470 $105.00f $49,350.00 $75.00 $35,250.00 $102.00 $47,940.00
5 HMA Surface Course, IL-9.5, Mix "C", N50 ton 570 $100.00{ $57,000.00 $75.00 $42,750.00 $102.00 $58,140.00
Total Bid: As Calculated $115,340.00 $139,324.00
As Read
[% Over/Under




