
Bidder & Address Total Bid Bid 

Security

Acknowledge 

Addenda

Comments

D Construction Inc.

1488 South Broadway

Coal City, IL  60450

$39,096.72 Bid Bond Yes

Wirkus Paving Company

PO Box 437 

Steger, IL 60475

$48,914.28 Bid Bond Yes

Murphy Construction Services

16W273 83rd Street Suite D

Burr Ridge, IL 60527

$52,380.02 Bid Bond Yes

Accu-Paving Company

2665 S 25th Ave

Broadview, IL 60155

No Bid

Paving Pros

2093 W. Station St.

Kankakee, IL 60901

No Bid

PT Ferro Construction

700 South Rowell Avenue

Joliet, IL  60433

No Bid

Troch McNeil Paving Company

2425 Pan Am Blvd

Elk Grove Village, IL 60007

No Bid

COAL CITY PUBLIC LIBRARY DISTRICT

2025 PARKING LOT IMPROVEMENT

 

BID TABULATION

Project No. 66521.00 

10:00a.m., Tuesday, August 5, 2025



BID LETTING: Coal City Public Library District

2025 Parking Lot Improvement

 

10:00a.m., Tuesday, August 5, 2025

NO. QTY UNIT ITEM UNIT 

PRICE

AMOUNT  UNIT PRICE  AMOUNT   UNIT PRICE     AMOUNT     UNIT PRICE      AMOUNT    

1 1782 SY HMA Surface Removal, 2" $6.00 $10,692.00 $4.85 $8,642.70 $5.00 $8,910.00 $10.38 $18,497.16

2 802 LB Bituminous Materials (Tack Coat) $0.01 $8.02 $0.01 $8.02 $0.01 $8.02 $0.01 $8.02

3 80 TON Leveling Binder, Machine Method, 3/4" $125.00 $10,000.00 $110.00 $8,800.00 $175.00 $14,000.00 $123.00 $9,840.00

4 160 TON HMA Surface Course, IL-9.5, Mix "D", N50, 1 1/2" $125.00 $20,000.00 $110.00 $17,600.00 $175.00 $28,000.00 $123.00 $19,680.00

5 1122 FT Paint Pavement Marking - Line, 4" $1.50 $1,683.00 $3.00 $3,366.00 $1.00 $1,122.00 $0.55 $617.10

6 68 SF Paint Pavement Marking - Letters & Symbols $10.00 $680.00 $10.00 $680.00 $5.00 $340.00 $4.00 $272.00

TOTAL $43,063.02 $39,096.72 $52,380.02 $48,914.28

D Construction Inc.

1488 South Broadway

Coal City, IL  60450

BIDDER & ADDRESS Approved Engineers 

Estimate

Murphy Construction Services

16W273 83rd Street Suite D

Burr Ridge, IL 60527

Wirkus Paving Company

PO Box 437 

Steger, IL 60475

Bid BondBID DEPOSIT Bid Bond Bid Bond

ACKNOWLEDGE ADDENDA Yes Yes Yes


