
Bidder & Address Total Bid Bid 

Security

Acknowledge 

Addenda

Comments

Brandt Excavating, Inc. 

385 E. Hoover Street 

Morris, IL  60450

$2,146,850.00 Bid Bond Yes

Five Star Energy Services

1581 E Racine Ave.

Waukesha, WI 53186

$2,231,100.00 Bid Bond Yes

Stip Bros Excavating, Inc.

PO Box 365 

Elwood, IL 60421

$2,799,770.00 Bid Bond Yes

D Construction Inc.

1488 South Broadway

Coal City, IL  60450

$3,865,338.00 Bid Bond Yes

IHC Construction Companies, LLC

385 Airport Rd. Suite 100

Elgin, IL 60123

$3,924,167.00 Bid Bond Yes

Bisping Construction Co, Inc.

110 Ford Drive

New Lenox, IL 60451

No Bid

Core and Main

115 N. Cummings Lane

Washington, IL  61571

No Bid

Gene Wren Construction, LLC

PO Box 164

Coal City, IL 60416

No Bid

PT Ferro Construction

700 South Rowell Avenue

Joliet, IL  60433

No Bid

Williams Concrete

9005 W. Spring Rd.

Coal City, IL 60416

No Bid

VILLAGE OF COAL CITY

LEAD SERVICE LINES REPLACEMENT

 

BID TABULATION

Project No. 9875.04 

10:00AM, Tuesday, April 16th, 2024



BID LETTING: Village of Coal City

Lead Service Lines Replacement

 

10:00AM, Tuesday, April 16th, 2024

NO. QTY UNIT ITEM UNIT 

PRICE  

AMOUNT   UNIT PRICE     AMOUNT      UNIT PRICE     AMOUNT     UNIT PRICE      AMOUNT       UNIT PRICE    AMOUNT 

1 5 EA Water Service Line Box to Meter, Finished Basement, 1" $1,600.00 $8,000.00 $4,535.00 $22,675.00 $6,000.00 $30,000.00 $4,000.00 $20,000.00 $7,620.00 $38,100.00
2 5 EA Water Service Line Box to Meter, Unfinished Basement, 1" $1,500.00 $7,500.00 $3,535.00 $17,675.00 $6,000.00 $30,000.00 $4,000.00 $20,000.00 $4,108.00 $20,540.00
3 15 EA Water Service Line Box to Meter, Crawl Space, 1" $1,200.00 $18,000.00 $3,535.00 $53,025.00 $6,000.00 $90,000.00 $4,000.00 $60,000.00 $4,108.00 $61,620.00
4 1 EA Water Service Line Box to Meter, Slab, 1" $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $4,535.00 $4,535.00 $3,600.00 $3,600.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $6,547.00 $6,547.00
5 207 EA Water Service Line main to Box Long, 1" $3,450.00 $714,150.00 $4,500.00 $931,500.00 $3,700.00 $765,900.00 $4,500.00 $931,500.00 $5,294.00 $1,095,858.00
6 300 EA Water Service Line Main to Box Short, 1" $3,450.00 $1,035,000.00 $4,400.00 $1,320,000.00 $3,250.00 $975,000.00 $6,000.00 $1,800,000.00 $5,272.23 $1,581,669.00
7 200 LF Miscellaneous Tile Repair $30.00 $6,000.00 $10.00 $2,000.00 $10.00 $2,000.00 $100.00 $20,000.00 $164.34 $32,868.00
8 507 EA Domestic Water Service Shut Off $300.00 $152,100.00 $380.00 $192,660.00 $400.00 $202,800.00 $1,334.00 $676,338.00 $1,672.00 $847,704.00
9 507 EA Exploration Trench, Special $300.00 $152,100.00 $400.00 $202,800.00 $200.00 $101,400.00 $500.00 $253,500.00 $232.00 $117,624.00

10 1 LS Traffic Control and Protection $1,800.00 $1,800.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $3,333.00 $3,333.00
11 400 SY Class D Patching $80.00 $32,000.00 $85.00 $34,000.00 $25.00 $10,000.00 $90.00 $36,000.00 $172.65 $69,060.00
12 26 EA House Grounding $700.00 $18,200.00 $150.00 $3,900.00 $400.00 $10,400.00 $500.00 $13,000.00 $1,894.00 $49,244.00

TOTAL $2,146,850.00 $2,799,770.00 $2,231,100.00 $3,865,338.00 $3,924,167.00

Stip Bros Excavating, Inc.

PO Box 365 

Elwood, IL 60421

BIDDER & ADDRESS Brandt Excavating, Inc. 

385 E. Hoover Street 

Morris, IL  60450

Five Star Energy Services

1581 E Racine Ave.

Waukesha, WI 53186

D Construction Inc.

1488 South Broadway

Coal City, IL  60450

IHC Construction Companies, LLC

385 Airport Rd. Suite 100

Elgin, IL 60123
Bid BondBID DEPOSIT Bid Bond Bid Bond Bid Bond Bid Bond

ACKNOWLEDGE ADDENDA Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes


