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Brandt Excavating, Inc. 
385 E. Hoover Street 
Morris, IL  60450

$403,488.11 Bid Bond Yes

Scanlon Excavating & Concrete, Inc.
630 S. 7000W Road
Kankakee, IL  60901

$589,580.00 Bid Bond Yes

D Construction Inc.
1488 South Broadway
Coal City, IL  60450

$667,830.00 Bid Bond Yes

Conley Excavating 
1555 Gramercy Place 
Morris, IL  60450

$682,460.00 Bid Bond Yes

Opperman Construction Co. 
16535 N. 1650 East Road 
Pontiac, IL  61764

No Bid

PT Ferro Construction
700 South Rowell Avenue
Joliet, IL  60433

No Bid

Stott Contracting 
6630 N. Ashton Road 
Morris, IL  60450

No Bid

Superior Excavating
424 San Carlos Road
Minooka, IL  60447

No Bid

VILLAGE OF COAL CITY
CARBON, ELM & SPRING WATER MAIN

BID TABULATION

Project No. 9956.00 

10:00AM, Thursday, January 4, 2024



BID LETTING: Village of Coal City
Carbon, Elm & Spring Water Main
 
10:00AM, Thursday, January 4, 2024

NO. QTY UNIT ITEM  UNIT PRICE   AMOUNT   UNIT PRICE      AMOUNT      UNIT PRICE     AMOUNT        UNIT 
PRICE 

  AMOUNT 

1 1100 CY Trench Backfill, Special $48.00 $52,800.00 $39.00 $42,900.00 $0.01 $11.00 $65.00 $71,500.00
2 1400 SY HMA Patching, 6" $55.00 $77,000.00 $72.00 $100,800.00 $50.00 $70,000.00 $60.00 $84,000.00
3 1 LS Traffic Control $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $83,300.00 $83,300.00 $52,000.00 $52,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00
4 680 LF PVC Watermain, 8" $186.00 $126,480.00 $123.00 $83,640.00 $65.00 $44,200.00 $130.00 $88,400.00
5 950 LF PVC Watermain ‐ Owner Supplied, 10"  $144.00 $136,800.00 $85.00 $80,750.00 $55.00 $52,250.00 $106.00 $100,700.00
6 150 LF PVC Watermain, 10"  $153.00 $22,950.00 $121.00 $18,150.00 $90.00 $13,500.00 $115.00 $17,250.00
7 15 EA Water Service Connection $3,750.00 $56,250.00 $3,100.00 $46,500.00 $2,400.00 $36,000.00 $3,000.00 $45,000.00
8 4 EA Fire Hydrant With Auxiliary Valve $9,000.00 $36,000.00 $9,550.00 $38,200.00 $7,500.00 $30,000.00 $8,000.00 $32,000.00
9 7 EA 8" Water Valve $3,500.00 $24,500.00 $3,290.00 $23,030.00 $2,800.00 $19,600.00 $3,600.00 $25,200.00
10 3 EA 10" Water Valve $4,500.00 $13,500.00 $4,900.00 $14,700.00 $3,800.00 $11,400.00 $4,500.00 $13,500.00
11 180 SY Driveway Removal and Replacement, Aggregate $40.00 $7,200.00 $30.00 $5,400.00 $15.00 $2,700.00 $30.00 $5,400.00
12 50 SY Driveway Removal and Replacement, PCC $150.00 $7,500.00 $160.00 $8,000.00 $150.00 $7,500.00 $180.00 $9,000.00
13 1 LS Parkway Restoration $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $17,000.00 $17,000.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00
14 175 SF Portland Cement Concrete Sidewalk, 5" $20.00 $3,500.00 $30.00 $5,250.00 $15.00 $2,625.00 $35.00 $6,125.00
15 300 LF Combination Curb and Gutter Removal and Replacement $80.00 $24,000.00 $70.00 $21,000.00 $30.00 $9,000.00 $100.00 $30,000.00
16 50 LF Miscellaneous Tile Repair $100.00 $5,000.00 $70.00 $3,500.00 $50.00 $2,500.00 $30.00 $1,500.00
17 50 LF Exploration Trench, Special $100.00 $5,000.00 $70.00 $3,500.00 $50.00 $2,500.00 $60.00 $3,000.00
18 32 SF Dectectable Warnings, Special $50.00 $1,600.00 $50.00 $1,600.00 $0.01 $0.32 $40.00 $1,280.00
19 4 EA Structure to Be Removed $1,000.00 $4,000.00 $500.00 $2,000.00 $500.00 $2,000.00 $725.00 $2,900.00
20 1 EA Pressure Connection $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $11,250.00 $11,250.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $7,650.00 $7,650.00
21 7 EA Cut In Connection $2,000.00 $14,000.00 $7,650.00 $53,550.00 $4,000.00 $28,000.00 $2,200.00 $15,400.00
22 4 EA Fire Hydrant To Be Removed $3,500.00 $14,000.00 $1,500.00 $6,000.00 $0.01 $0.04 $1,250.00 $5,000.00
23 175 SF Sidewalk Removal $10.00 $1,750.00 $20.00 $3,500.00 $0.01 $1.75 $5.00 $875.00
24 60 LF Storm Sewers, 10" Water Main Quality $100.00 $6,000.00 $149.00 $8,940.00 $70.00 $4,200.00 $65.00 $3,900.00
TOTAL $667,830.00 $682,460.00 $403,488.11 $589,580.00

Yes Yes Yes YesACKNOWLEDGE ADDENDA
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D Construction Inc.
1488 South Broadway
Coal City, IL  60450

Conley Excavating 
1555 Gramercy Place 
Morris, IL  60450

Brandt Excavating, Inc. 
385 E. Hoover Street 
Morris, IL  60450

Scanlon Excavating & Concrete, Inc.
630 S. 7000W Road
Kankakee, IL  60901

BIDDER & ADDRESS


